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BAC Resolution Declaring SCRB and Recommending Approval
RESOLUTION NO. 061(12-20)

WHEREAS, the PICC-BAC advertised, through posting in the Phil-GEPS and in the bulletin board of the BAC
Secretariat, the Invitation to Bid for the Supply and Delivery of Various Mechanical Supplies, Parts and Materials
consisting of six (6) lots, with an Approved Budget for Contract (ABC) of SEVEN MILLION SEVEN
HUNDRED SIXTY-SEVEN THOUSAND FOUR HUNDRED SIXTY-NINE PESOS AND TWENTY-
FIVE CENTAVOS (P7,767,469.25), VAT Inclusive;

WHEREAS, the sub-ABCs are as follows; Lot T - One Hundred Twelve Thousand One Hundred Fifteen Pesos and
Ninety-Five Centavos (P112,115.95}; Lot IT - Six Million Six Hundred Twenty-Six Thousand Five Hundred
Severty-Six Pesos and Ninety Centavos (P6,626,576.90); Lot III - One Hundred One Thousand Six Hundred
Thirty-Seven Pesos (P101,637.00), Lot IV - One Hundred Eight Thousand Three Hundred Fifty-Eight Pesos
and Seventy-Five Centavos (P108,358.75); Lot V - Seven Hundred Fifty-Three Thousand Six Hundred Thirty-
Six Pesos and Forty Centavos (P753,636.40) and Lot VI - Sixty-Five Thousand One Hundred Forty-Four
Pesos and Twenty-Five Centavos (P65,144.25);

WHEREAS, in response to the said posting, only one {1) supplier, PRIMEGOODS TRADING AND ELECTRICAL
SUPPL CO. ("Primegoods"), obtained/paid for the bid documents and submitted bid documents on November
23, 2020. The proposal of the lone bidder was found to be substantially complying:

5 ot b-AR b d VARIANCE
escription Sub-ABC rimegoods Amount %
Lot I — ELECTRICAL CONTROLS AND .
DEVICES P112,115.95 No bid 0] 0
Lot II - AIRCONDITIONING SYSTEM PARTS AND .
ACCESSORIES P6,626,576.90 No bid O 0
Lot IIT - VARIOUS CONSUMABLE MATERIALS & . :
DEVICES P101,637.00 No bid 0 4]
Lot IV ~ MITSUBISHI ELEVATOR AND PARTS ?108,358.75 No bid O 0
LotV - FIRE SUPPRESSION SYSTEM FOR MAIN & -
SATELLITE KITCHEN P753,636.40 P752,750.00 P886.40 0.12
Lot VI ~ MATERIALS FOR VARIOUS MECHANICAL -
FABRICATION WORKS PG5,144.25 P62,450.00 P2,694.25 4.14

WHEREAS, upon careful examination, validation and verification by the Technical Working Group
(TWG)} of all the eligibility, technical and financial requirements, as well as the post-qualification
documents submitted by, Primegoods for Lot V and Lot VI, the same were found to be complying and
responsive; and

NOW, THEREFORE, We, the Members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby RESOLVE, as it is hereby
RESQLVED:

a) To recommend to the PICC General Manager the award to Primegoods which submitted the
single calculated and responsive bid for Lot V - whose total offer of P752,750.00 and Lot VI -
whose total offer of P62,450.00, are within the sub-ABC;

b} To declare a Failed Bid for Lots I, I, I1I, and IV and schedule a RE-BID to for such
reguirements.

RESOLVED, at the PICC, this 22" day of December, 2020.
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MELETN A, GONZAGA
, ’f Chairman ¢
LIZABETH B, AGUILA PERCIVAL M. SALONGA
Vice-Chairperso M ar
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Mem nd-user
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General ager



