## PHILIPPINE INTERNATIONAL CONVENTION CENTER

Standard Form Number: SF-GOOD-48

Revised on: May 24, 2004

## BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING SCRB AND RECOMMENDING APPROVAL

## **RESOLUTION NO. 045(11-20)**

WHEREAS, the PICC-BAC advertised, through posting in the Phil-GEPS, PICC Website and in the bulletin board of the BAC Secretariat, the Invitation to Bid for the **Supply and Delivery of Various Electrical and Electronics Supplies, Parts and Materials**, consisting of five (5) lots, with a total Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC) of **THREE MILLION TWO HUNDRED FIFTY-NINE THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED SIXTY-FIVE PESOS (\$\mathbf{P}3,259,265.00)**, **VAT inclusive**;

WHEREAS, the sub-ABCs are as follows; **Lot I** – One Million Four Hundred Forty Thousand Two Hundred Ninety Pesos (**P1,440,290.00**); **Lot II** – Four Hundred Sixty-five Thousand Pesos (**P465,000.00**); **Lot III** – Six Hundred Twenty-Two Thousand Five Hundred Five Pesos (**P622,505.00**) **Lot IV** – Two Hundred Seventy-Nine Thousand One Hundred Twenty Pesos (**P279,120.00**) and **Lot V** – Four Hundred Fifty-Two Thousand Three Hundred Fifty Pesos (**P452,350.00**);

WHEREAS, in response to the said posting, only one (1) bidder, **VIVA SALES ENTERPRISES** ("VSE"), obtained and paid the bid documents and submitted an application for eligibility on October 21, 2020. The bid proposal of the lone bidder was found to be substantially complying for lot five (5) only:

Description	ABC	VSE	VARIANCE	
			Amount	%
Lot I – Equipment and Devices	₱1,440,290.00	No bid	0	0
Lot II - Safety Equipment	₱465,000.00	No bid	0	0
Lot III - Lamps and Bulbs	₱622,505.00	No bid	0	0
Lot IV – Metering Devices	₱279,120.00	No bid	0	0
Lot V - Electronic Materials	₱452,350.00	₱450,630.00	₱1,720.00	0.38

WHEREAS, upon careful examination, validation and verification by the Technical Working Group (TWG) of all the eligibility, technical and financial requirements, as well as the post-qualification documents submitted by VSE, its bid was found to be responsive.

NOW, THEREFORE, We, the Members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby RESOLVE, as it is hereby RESOLVED, to recommend to the PICC General Manager the award to VSE of the aforesaid requirement, as the bidder with the Single Calculated and Responsive Bid whose total offer of P450,630.00 is within the ABC.

RESOLVED, FURTHER, to conduct a **Negotiated Procurement** for Lots I, II III and IV, thereof in accordance with Section 53.1 (Two failed bids) of the Revised Implementing Rules and Regulation of Republic Act 9184.

RESOLVED at the PICC, this 5th day of November, 2020.

MELPIN A. GONZAGA Chairman

Chairman

ELIZABETH B. AGUILA Vice-Chairperson

STANA

PERCIVAL M S Member

ROMULO N. BACAS

End-user

SALONGA

MARIA SOCORRO S. AVILA Member

Approved on:\_\_\_\_\_