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BAC Resolution Declaring LCRB and Recommending Approval

RESOLUTION NO. 033(07-21)

WHEREAS, the PICC-BAC advertised, through posting in the Phil-GEPS, PICC Website and in the
bulletin board of the BAC Secretariat, the Invitation to Bid for the Supply and Delivery of Regular
Housekeeping Supplies, with a total Approved Budget for Contract (ABC) of TWO MILLION NINE
HUNDRED FIFTY-FIVE THOUSAND FOUR HUNDRED SIXTY-TWO PESOS AND SEVENTY CENTAVOS
(P2,955,462.70), VAT inclusive, consisting of three (3) lots;

i

A
WHEREAS, In response to the said posting, three (3) suppliers, namely: ECO-HYGIENE INSTITUTIONAL
SALES (“Eco-Hygiene”), PRIMESOLV TECHNOLOGIES CO. {"Primesclv”) and CARE 15T CORP. (“Care 1%7),
obtained/paid for the bid documents. All bidders were declared Eligible and their bid proposals were as
follows:

Description of Lower Bidder
1 P ABC Eco-Hygiene Primesolv CARE 1ist Variance
tems
Amount %
Lot I - Toilet P541,662.00 | P344,544.00 No bid P527,712.00 | P197,118.00 | 36.39
Tissue Paper
Lot I - Interfolded | po0c 590 0o | P250,500.00 No bid P300,600.00 | P135,270.00 | 35.06
Paper Towel
Lot III - Various
Housekeeping P2,028,030.70 No bid P1,167,263.00 No bid P860,767.70 | 42.44
Supplies

WHEREAS, upon careful examination, validation and verification of all the eligibility, technical and
financial documents, as well as post-qualification documents submitted by the lowest-ranked

«, bidders, Eco-Hygiene for Lot I and Lot 11 and Primesolv for Lot 111, the same were found to be complying
and responsive;

NOW, THEREFORE, We, the Members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby RESOLVE, as it is
hereby RESOLVED, to recommend to the PICC General Manager the following:

a) To award to Eco-Hygiene, the bidder with the lower calculated and responsive bid for the
Supply and Delivery of Toilet Tissue Paper {Lot I}, whose total offer of P344,544.00 is within
ABC and Supply and Delivery of Interfolded Paper Towel (Lot 11}, whose total offer of
P250,500.00 is within the ABC; and

b) To award to Primesolv, as the single calculated and responsive bid for the Supply and
Delivery of Various Housekeeping Supplies, whose total offer of P1,167,263.00 is within the
ABC.

RESOLVED, at the PICC, this 5% day of July, 2021.
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MELPIN A. GONZAGA

/Z Chairman
ELAZABETH B. AGUIL PERCIVAL M. ONGA
ice-Chairperson Membe

GLBENN L. PELONIO
Member/End-user

Approved on
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