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BAC Resolution Declaring LCRB and Recommending Approval
RESOLUTION NO. 042(07-21)

WHEREAS, the PICC-BAC advertised, through posting in the Phil-GEPS, PICC Website and in the bulletin board
of the BAC Secretariat, the Invitation to Bid for the Supply and Delivery of Various Hardware Supplies, Parts
and Materials consisting of six (6) lots, with a total Approved Budget for Contract (ABC) of FOUR MILLION
ONE HUNDRED SEVENTY-FIVE THOUSAND EIGHTY FOUR PESOS AND NINETY-THREE
CENTAVOS (P4,175,084.93), VAT inclusive;

WHEREAS, the sub-ABCs are as follows; Lot I: Carpentry Materials - ONE MILLION ONE HUNDRED FIFTY-
FIVE THOUSAND THREE HUNDRED SEVENTY-ONE PESOS AND SEVENTY-FIVE CENTAVOS (#1,155,371.75);
Lot II: Painting and Varnishing - ONE MILLION TWO HUNDRED FORTY-SEVEN THOUSAND ONE HUNDRED
EIGHTY-TWO PESOS (P1,247,182.00); Lot III: Plumbing Materials - ONE MILLION FIVE HUNDRED
TWENTY-SEVEN THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED SIX PESOS AAND SIXTY-EIGHT CENTAVOS (#1,527,806.68);
Lot IV: Metal Works Materials - SIXTY-TWO THOUSAND THREE HUNDRED FORTY-FIVE PESOS
(P62,345.00); Lot V: Masonry Materials - ONE HUNDRED TWENTY-FOUR THOUSAND NINE HUNDRED
EIGHTY PESOS (P124,980.00) and Lot VI: Parts and Tools - FIFTY-SEVEN THOUSAND THREE HUNDRED
NINETY-NINE PESOS AND FIFTY CENTAVOS (P57,399.50);

WHEREAS, in response to the said posting, five (5) suppliers, namely: ECS ROAD TRAFFICE SUPPLY
ENTERPRISE (“"ECS Road”), UP-TOWN INDUSTRIAL SALES, INC. (“Up-town”), PRIMEGOODS TRADING AND
ELECTRICAL SUPPL CO. (“"PRIMEGOODS"), VIVA SALES ENTERPRISES ("WSE") AND ST. CHRIST
INTERNATIONAL TRADING (“St. Christ”) obtained/paid for the bid documents. During the public bidding on
June 22, 2021, ECS Road did not submit bid documents. Up-Town, Primegoods, VSE and St. Christ were
declared ELIGIBLE and their bid proposals were as follows:

Description Sub-ABC Primegoods St. Christ Up-Town Viva

Lot I — Carpentry
Ml P1,155,371.75| 1,153,875.00 | 1,023,709.00 | 1,153,642.50 | 1,046,271.00

Lot IT - Supply and

Delivery of Painting and| #1,247,182.00 1,123,645.00 | = No bid No bid 905,810.70 ~
Varnishing Materials

Lot IIT - Supply and

qu‘tiv‘?ﬂ[/ of Plumbing | £1,527,806.68| 1 408,751.00 No bid 1,298,382.30 | 1,223,687.60
ateriais

l.ot IV - Supply and

Delivery of Metal Works £62,345.00 No bid No bid No bid 62,075.00
Materials

Lot V - Supply and

Delivery of Masonry P124,980.00 | 106,680.00 No bid No bid 109,295.00
Materials

Lot VI - Supply and

?e’fl‘-'ew of Parts and P57,399.50 | 52 164.00 No bid No bid 47,337.50
00Ils

WHEREAS, upon careful examination, validation and verification by the Technical Working Group (TWG) of all
the eligibility, technical and financial documents, as well as post-qualification documents submitted by the first-
ranked bidders, the BAC, in its meeting on July 28, 2021, found the bid offers of VSE for Lots II, III, IV and VI,
St. Christ for Lot I, and Primegoods for Lot V, to be complying and responsive;

Description Sub-ABC sh:,g ap“;ﬁ;,‘; Bid Offer Amour::ariance %
Lot I P1,155371.75 | st. Christ 1,023,709.00 131,662.75 11.40
Lot II P1,247,182.00 VSE 905,810.70 341,371.30 27.37
Lot I1I P1,527,806.68 VSE 1,223,687.60 304,119.08 19.90
Lot IV $62,345.00 VSE &2 075 00 270 AR - M




NOW, THEREFORE, We, the Members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby RESOLVE, as it is hereby
RESOLVED, to recommend to the PICC General Manager the following:

a) Award to VSE, which submitted the lowest calculated and responsive bid for Lots II, III, IV and
VI, whose total offer of #905,810.70, #1,223,687.60, #62,075.00 and P47,337.50 respectively,
are within the sub-ABC;

b) Award to St. Christ, which submitted the lowest calculated and responsive bid for Lot I whose
total offer of £1,023,709.00, is within sub-ABC;

c¢) Award to Primegoods, which submitted the lowest calculated and responsive bid for Lot V whose
total offer of P106,680.00, is within sub-ABC; and

RESOLVED, at the PICC, this 28t day of July, 2021.
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. Chairman
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