PHILIPPINE INTERNATIONAL CONVENTION CENTER
Standard Form Number: SF-GOOD-48
Revised on: May 24, 2004

BAC Resolution Declaring LCRB and Recommending Award
RESOLUTION NO. 12(03-23)

WHEREAS, the PICC-BAC advertised, through posting in the Phil-GEPS, PICC Website and in the
bulletin board of the BAC Secretariat, the Invitation to Bid for the Supply and Delivery of Various
Hardware Supplies, Parts and Materials consisting of six (6) lots, with a total Approved Budget for
Contract (ABC) of FOUR MILLION EIGHT HUNDRED SIXTY-SEVEN THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED
FORTY-THREE PESOS AND THIRTY CENTAVOS (P4,867,243.30), VAT inclusive;

WHEREAS, the sub-ABCs are as follows; Lot I: Carpentry and Masonry Materials — ONE MILLION
THREE THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED EIGHTY-EIGHT PESOS AND FIFTY CENTAVOS (£1,003,588.50);
Lot II: Painting and Varnishing Materials - TWO HUNDRED ONE THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED FOUR
PESOS (P201,504.00); Lot III: Plumbing Materials - TWO MILLION EIGHT HUNDRED FIVE
THOUSAND FOUR HUNDRED TWO PESOS AND FIFTY CENTAVOS (P2,805,402.50); Lot IV: Metal
Works Materials — SEVEN HUNDRED FOURTEEN THOUSAND FIFTY PESQOS AND EIGHTY CENTAVQOS
(P714,050.80); Lot V: Parts and Tools - EIGHTY-ONE THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED NINETY-
SEVEN PESOS AND FIFTY CENTAVOS (P81,797.50); Lot VI: Power Tools — SIXTY THOUSAND NINE
HUNDRED PESCS (P60,900.00);

WHEREAS, in response to the said posting, five (5) suppliers, namely: BUILTRADE CONSTRUCTION
SUPPLY (“BCS"), VIVA SALES ENTERPRISES (“WSE”), MARELCO TRADING CORP. ("MTC"),
PRIMEGOODS TRADING AND ELECTRICAL SUPPLY CO. (“Primegoods”) and UP-TOWN INDUSTRIAL
SALES, INC. (“Up-Town”), obtained/paid for the bid documents. BCS was declared Ineligible for
failure to submit 2023 Mayor’s Permit. Other bidders were declared Eligible and their bid proposals
were as follows:

Description Sub-ABC VSE Marelco Primegoods Up-town

Lot I = Carpentry and

Masonry £1,003,588.50 P973,031.00 No bid No bid P936,000.00

Materials
Lot II - Painting and

Varnishing P201,504.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid

Materials
Lot 111 "Pﬁgﬁgggg $2,805,402.50 | P2,461,934.00| P2,498,346.00| £2,429,441.00 No bid
LBt Bf=Mctal \iork $714,050.80 | P709,026.00 No bid No bid No bid

Materials

L0 % Pelfls Bl $81,797.50 No bid No bid No bid No bid
Tools
Lot VI - Power Tools £60,900.0 No bid No bid No bid No bid

WHEREAS, upon careful examination, validation and verification by the Technical Working Group
(TWG) of all the eligibility, technical and financial documents, as well as post-qualification
documents submitted by the first ranked bidders, the BAC, in its meeting on April 20, 2022, found
the bid offer submitted by Primegoods for Lot III found to be incorrect. Up-town offer for Lot I and
VSE for Lots III and IV, found to be complying and responsive;

I Name of , Variance
Description Sub-ABC Suppliers Bid Offer Amount e
Lot I P£1,003,588.50 Up-town P936,000.00 P67,588.50 6.73
Lot III P2,805,402.50 VSE P2,461,934.00 P343,468.50 12.24
Lot IV £714,050.80 VSE £709,026.00 £5,024.80 0.70

NOW THERFEFFORE We the Members of the Rids and Awarde Committee herebv RESO|I V/F =3¢ it ic



c) To recommend for approval by the General Manager of the Philippine International
Convention Center the above foregoing findings; and

d) To declare a Failed Bid for Lots II, V and VI, and schedule a RE-BID to for such
requirement.

RESOLVED, at the PICC, this 8™ day of March, 2023.

La s
MELPIN A. GONZAGA
Chairman
ELIZABETH B. AGUILA PERCIVAL M. ONGA
Vice-Chairperson Member

EDISON f. AURELIO
user

Approved on

RENAT ME&LLA

General Manager




