PHILIPPINE INTERNATIONAL CONVENTION CENTER

Standard Form Number: SF-GOOD-48

Revised on: May 24, 2004

BAC Resolution Declaring LCRB and Recommending Approval

RESOLUTION NO. 23(04-24)

WHEREAS, the PICC-BAC advertised, through posting in the Phil-GEPS, PICC Website and in the bulletin board of the BAC Secretariat, the Invitation to Bid for the **Supply and Delivery of Central Processing Units (CPU), Laptops and Various Computer Peripherals** (consisting of three (3) lots) an Approved Budget for Contract (ABC) of **THREE MILLION FOUR HUNDRED EIGHTY THOUSAND PESOS (P3,480,000.00)**, **VAT inclusive**;

WHEREAS, in response to the said posting, eight (8) bidders, namely; JARHENS IRADING ("Jarhens"), XITRIX COMPUTER CORP. ("Xitrix"), DIGI-SPECS I.T. CORP. ("Digi-Specs"), AG INFOTECH SOLUTIONS, INC. (AG Infotech"), MACHINE & COMPUTER WORLD, INC. ("MCWI)", DATACORE TECHNOLOGIES, INC. ("Data Core"), AGILE TECHFRONTIER CORP. ("ATC") and NUNTIUS ELECTRONICS, INC. ("NEI"), obtained the bid documents and submitted the prequalifying documents for the bidding on March 27, 2024. Three (3) bidders namely; Xitrix, Data Core and AG Infotech were declared Eligible and their bid proposal were as follows:

Description	Sub-ABC	XITRIX	DATA CORE	AG INFOTECH	
Lot I – Central Processing Units	₱5,219,000.00	P4,896,074.38	No bid	No bid	
Lot II – Laptops	P960,000.00	No bid	No bid	P958,240.00	
Lot III – Various Computer Peripherals	P 928,660.00	No bid	₱924,080.00	₱1,003,850.00 (TWG Computation)	

WHEREAS, upon careful examination, validation and verification by the Technical Working Group (TWG) of all the eligibility, technical and financial documents, as well as post-qualification documents submitted by the first ranked bidders, the BAC, in its meeting on April 25, 2024, found the bid offers submitted by Xitrix for Lot I, AG Infotech for Lot II and Data Core for Lot III, to be complying and responsive;

Description	Sub-ABC	Name of Suppliers	Bid Offer	VARIANCE	
				Amount	%
Lot I – Central Processing Units	₱5,219,000.00	Xitrix	P4,896,074.38	₱322,925.62	6.19
Lot II - Laptops	₱960,000.00	AG Infotech	₱958,240.00	₱1,760.00	0.18
Lot III - Various Computer Peripherals	P928,660.00	Data Core	P924,080.00	₱4,580.00	0.49

NOW, THEREFORE, We, the Members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby RESOLVE, as it is hereby RESOLVED, the following:

- a) To recommend for approval by the General Manager, the award to Xitrix of Lot I, as the bidder with the Lone Calculated and Responsive Bid, whose total offer of \$\mathbb{P}4,896,074.38\$ is within the sub-ABC.
- b) To recommend for approval by General Manager, the award to AG Infotech of Lot II, as the bidder with the Lone Calculated and Responsive Bid, whose total offer of \$\text{P958,240.00}\$ is within the sub-ABC.
- c) To recommend for approval by General Manager, the award to Data Core of Lot III, as the bidder with the Lower Calculated and Responsive bid, whose total offer of \$\frac{1}{2}924,080.00\$, is within the sub-ABC.

RESOLVED at the PICC, this 25^{th} and 29^{th} day of April, 2024.

MELPIN A. GONZAGA Chairman

M. bul B. AGUILF ELITABETH B. AGUILF Vice-Chairperson

PERCIVAL M. SALONGA Member

MARIA SOCORRO S. AVILA Member MARNIE F ONIA End-user

Approved on:___

RENATO B. PADILLA General Manager